
 

Flexible Instruction Activities - LC1 

Choose one activity from each column below for the classes of Language Arts, Math, Science, and Specials. You can 

either write or draw for each activity. Send it in to school the next school day or take a picture and text or email your 

teacher. If your child does this for the day, they will be able to be marked as attending school for the day. 

 

 

Snow 
Day 

Language Arts Math Science Specials Group 

1 

Choose one letter of 
the alphabet and 
find 5 objects that 
start with that 
letter.  
 
Write or draw those 
objects. 

Find a circle, triangle 
square, and rectangle 
objects in your house. 
 
Draw pictures of 
them. 

Find 2 items that float 
and 2 items that sink.  
 
Draw a picture of it and 
whether it sunk or 
floated. 
 
(get permission from an 
adult for objects to use) 

Gym - Listen to a 
song and have a 
dance party. 

 

2 

Make a thank you 
card for a mail 
carrier/delivery 
person. 

Count how many cars 
pass your window in a 
5-minute time frame. 
 
Write the number 
down. 

Draw or write about the 
weather. 
 
Record the weather at 
breakfast, lunch and 
dinner. 

Music - Make your 
own instruments and 
have a concert.   
 
Draw a picture of the 
instrument. 

 

3 

Find a penny, pick it 
up, and write/draw 
a wish. 

Find numbers in your 
home and then write 
10 numbers you find. 
 
Examples: clocks, 
calendars 

Put an object on a 
windowsill and watch 
the pattern of the 
shadow throughout the 
day. 
 
Draw a picture from 
breakfast, lunch and 
dinner. 

Art - Draw a picture 
about what your 
“Perfect Day” would 
look like.   
 

 

4 

Look out your front 
door in the 
morning. 
 
Draw a picture of 
what you see and 
write a caption. 
 

Use a ruler, tape 
measurer, or other 
objects to measure 
something in your 
bedroom. 
 
Draw a picture of it 
and write 
measurement down. 

Take a walk with your 
family or look out your 
window. 
 
Draw a picture of 
something you see.  
 

Tech Ed. - List 5 items 
of technology that is 
in your house. 
 
Draw a picture or 
describe them. 
 

 

5 

Describe the dog 
below with words or 
draw a picture to 
look like this dog. 
 

 

Count how many 
windows and doors 
are in your house.  
 
Add the number 
together. Write the 
numbers in an 
addition number 
sentence. 
 
Example: 4+2=6 

Find an object in your 
house or outside and 
describe it using 3 of 
your senses. 
 
(See, hear, feel, taste, 
smell) 
 

Library - Read or 
listen to a book.  
 
Write or draw the 
book title. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 


